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Congratulations to Post 142Congratulations to Post 142

~ continued on page 16

HAPPENINGS IN BOISE COUNTYHAPPENINGS IN BOISE COUNTY
OCTOBER 1 & 2 - Idaho City Days is hosted by the Chamber of Commerce. (See page 16!)
This is a festival for the whole family. Historic buildings will be open to the public. Enjoy games for 

the kids, performances, cowboy poets, food vendor, artisans, and much more!

OCTOBER 8 - Spooky Family Fall Festival at the Cowboy Campground in Idaho City. (See page 8)

Congratulations to VFWCongratulations to VFW
Boise Basin Post 142Boise Basin Post 142

Micron's CommitmentMicron's Commitment
to Invest in Idaho's to Invest in Idaho's 
Future WorkforceFuture WorkforceDuring their monthly meet-

ing on Saturday, September 
17th, Veterans of Foreign Wars 
Post 142 was recognized for 
their sixth award in the past 
ten years, the coveted All-
American Post Award. In ad-
dition, the post was recognized 
with the All-State award and 
Commander Jim White (right) 
was given an individual leader-
ship award. The All-American 
Award was presented by Idaho 
District 5 Commander Troy 
Junier (left) in Idaho City at the 
senior center, where the district 
later enjoyed a meal together.

Photos by Eileen Capson

Money is being raised for a 
new memorial to be placed at 
the Veteran's Park in Idaho 
City, where Java and other ser-
vice animals will be recognized. 
Drawing close to the end of her 
life, Java was still cheerful to 
greet veterans and friends at the 
VFW gathering. She has been a 
great help to Mr. Tam, an Iraq 
and Afganistan veteran, over the 
past ten years. She had special-
ized training targeting integra-
tion, socialization, and the mo-
bility of veterans. In addition, 
Java  has diabetic and seizure 
training, and has been known to 
let others know if their insulin is 
dangerously low.

Java will be recognized at an 
event in Idaho City on Saturday, 
Sept. 24th, from 1-5pm on Main 
Street near Harley's Pub. Do-
nations are welcome and so are 
potluck dishes.

Capt. Dan Ashley from the 
Vet Center made the trip up to 
Idaho City on Saturday to share 
with the veterans some of the 
services that they offer, separate 
from the V.A. Their services in-
clude counseling, referrals, and 
community engagement. The 
Vet Center prioritizes safe re-
cord keeping, confidentiality 
even from the DoD and VA of-
fices, and their services are at no 
cost. Call 877-WAR-VETS or go 
to www.va.gov/find-locations

Executive Director for the Micron Foundation, Dee Mooney
Photo by Eileen Capson

By Eileen Capson
BOISE COUNTY -- The 

Micron Foundation is commit-
ted to greater STEM outreach 
and plans to extend investment 
in Idaho kindergarten through 
12th grade. They are especially 
looking to invest in under-rep-
resented and rural students. Mi-
cron has also partnered with the 
College of Western Idaho to de-
velop new curriculum that will 
lead the efforts in advanced 
technology in automation and 
semiconductors. Dee Mooney, 
with the Micron Foundation, 
says this will be an excellent 
opportunity for Idaho’s work-
force to increase their high tech 
jobs skills. She said this was 
the largest private investment 
to help develop future genera-
tions and grow the state’s econ-
omy. Micron is also working 
with the State Board of Educa-
tion, Next Steps Idaho, and Ida-
ho Workforce. Building a new 
facility in Boise will require a 
large workforce, but Micron's 
stated purpose for building is to 
bring back chip memory manu-
facturing to the United States.

Assistant Superintendent for 
Basin School District ReBekha 
Lulu was at the official ground-
breaking ceremony for the new 
facility and observed, “In the 
[educational] forum, they em-
phasized the need for creating 
a pipeline for Micron careers 
that includes K-12 and focuses 
more heavily on rural districts. 
This would be vital as the $15 
billion dollar investment will 
create thousands of new jobs 
locally. The panel also shared 
that there will be entry-level 
jobs that young people could 
access and they would then 
have access to Micron's em-

ployee education support pro-
gram, which provides the fund-
ing for continued education. 
This would be a huge help for 
those who cannot afford to pur-
sue a degree right out of high 
school, but are interested in the 
field.”

Chelsea Garecht, a Micron 
Senior Manager, added, “As 
part of the company’s ongoing 
commitment to invest in the 
Idaho community and further 
build our workforce, Micron 
will expand investment in K-12 
STEM education programs and 
increase focus on reaching un-
derrepresented and rural stu-
dent populations. 

Micron is also proud to an-
nounce a partnership with the 
College of Western Idaho to 
lead efforts in delivering key 
curricula, such as Advanced 
Mechatronics Engineering 
Technology, to prepare students 
for the Micron Technician Ap-
prenticeship Program. This will 
include the College of Western 
Idaho classroom instruction 
on Micron's Boise Campus. 
Together with the College of 
Western Idaho, Micron expects 
to establish programs to reduce 
the financial burden for stu-
dents to continue their educa-
tion path. This would include, 
but is not limited to, scholar-
ships, lab equipment, transpor-
tation and faculty support.”

Garecht said, “Additionally, 
the Micron Foundation contin-
ues to increase opportunity and 
reduce access gaps to STEM 
education and careers through 
implementing a portfolio of 
initiatives related to K-12 such 
as our Chip Camp, Job Shad-
ows, and Girls Going Tech pro-
grams.” 
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September 6, 2022
Present: Commissioners 

Steven Twilegar, Clay Tucker, 
and Ryan Stirm (via phone).

Pledge of Allegiance
CONSTITUENT INPUT: 

Debra Jackson asked for an 
update regarding getting docu-
ments added to the agenda. 
Clerk Mary Prisco responded 
that the deputy clerk was on 
vacation and they would dis-
cuss it when she got back. 
Jackson asked, “Is this going 
to be an easy transition?” Pris-
co replied, “We’re just going 
to link the PDF documents.”

MINUTES: Chairman Twi-
legar motioned to approve the 
minutes from August 30, 2022. 
All were in favor and the mo-
tion passed. He then motioned 
to accept the minutes from the 
special meeting on September 
1st, which was seconded by 
Commissioner Tucker and the 
motion carried.

TREASURER: Commis-
sioner Twilegar asked for an 
update. Treasurer Gina Turner 
said, “It’s terrible! I thought 
I was going to be coming in 
asking for a lot of money.” 
Twilegar interrupted and said, 
“Thank you for not doing 
that.” She responded that they 
were only able to “do it” for 
$1400. Twilegar said he was 
surprised by that. Turner said, 
“There were a lot of issues 
when we rebuilt the tax roll 
and it was charging interest on 
the Circuit Breaker payments.” 
Turner's employee was able 
to work around it, rather than 
write a whole new program. 
She added, “But then yester-
day, I discovered there’s about 
2,000 parcels [of land] where 
the mortgage is paid, or the 
tax payments, all of those got 
interest applied even though 
it was backdated.” Treasurer 
Turner is looking at going 
“into each parcel individually, 
reverse the payment, reverse 
off late charges interest, and 
then reapply the…” Commis-
sioner Twilegar broke in and 
asked how many parcels, then 
said, “Oh, crap.” Treasurer 
Turner said on a lighter note, 
“But, we rebuilt a tax roll from 
2021. We were only off by 92 
cents, verses last year when 
we built it. So, that’s good.” 
Chairman Twilegar responded, 
“That’s impressive… Wow, 
what a mess.”

SOLID WASTE: There was 
an application for a new hauler 
out of the Garden Valley area. 
Chairman Twilegar made a 
motion to approve the appli-
cation license and all were in 

favor, motion passed.
PLANNING AND ZON-

ING FEES: Administrator 
Alex Gross discussed a fee 
resolution that he was working 
on to increase their fees. He 
said they were using the data 
from 2015, and would like to 
use the current data with new 
evaluation data when it comes 
out. He said the international 
code council had been adopted 
by the state of Idaho, adopt-
ing building codes. Gross said 
the inspection fees would go 
down, but it increases the fees 
on the buildings. There are 
also inspections that they are 
not currently charging for, but 
would like to charge. It is not 
currently in their fee resolu-
tion, but the inspections are 
required. This change will re-
quire a public hearing.

CASTLE MOUNTAIN 
HOMES APPEAL - AVI-
MOR: Gross reported to the 
board that the neighbors filed 
an appeal. He would like to get 
rolling on this and suggested 
November 3rd for the appeal 
date. The date was agreed on 
by the clerk, even though it 
will be close to the election. 
There was discussion provid-
ed by Prosecutor Adam Strong 
regarding being incorporated 
within a city, and whether they 
annex from the county. Com-
missioner Twilegar motioned 
to approve a letter to the city 
of Eagle, “recommending that 
the city annex Avimor.” The 
motion was approved.

LICENSE RENEWAL: 
Clerk Prisco said the license 
for the clerk's and assessor's of-
fice was last renewed in 2018, 
but now they cannot access 
files and needed to look back 
in the original records. Chair-
man Twilegar said, “We’ve 
gotta do what we’ve gotta do,” 
and then motioned to renew 
the yearly license agreement 
for $3,620. This motion was 
also approved.

IDAHO CITY HISTORI-
CAL FOUNDATION: A 
piece of property was dis-
cussed as a contribution to the 
ICHF. Clerk Prisco will put 
together a resolution for the 
Veterans Memorial park.

NEW TRASH HAULING 
CONTRACTS: The updated 
contract for Miller Enterprises 
was presented by the prosecu-
tor. Commissioner Twilegar 
joked that it was “a messy 
business” and then motioned 
to approve the contract with 
the trash hauling company. 
This was approved. Then he 
motioned to approve the con-

tract with Republic, which was 
also approved. 

DEMAND WARRANTS: 
YMC had billed the county 
for twenty-five hours of labor, 
which concerned Prosecutor 
Strong. He called the com-
pany, who stated that they had 
made a mistake and the num-
ber of hours worked was ac-
tually nine. Strong presented 
the new invoice, which was 
$2,000 cheaper. Chairman 
Twilegar brought this to the 
attention of all the county em-
ployees and charged them to 
be “super careful about this” 
and to use their best judgment. 
The commissioner thanked 
Prosecutor Strong.

Clerk Prisco brought up an-
other issue with improving the 
courthouse’s airflow and bill-
ing that was done by YMC. 

Commissioner Twilegar mo-
tioned to approve the YMC in-
voice in the amount of $887. 
This motion carried. 

LOWMAN INN: There was 
a big push by local residents to 
reduce the speed limit through 
Lowman, Commissioner Twi-
legar said. The board put on 
the agenda that they would be 
at one of the community meet-
ings on September 14th. On 
Tuesday, September 20th, the 
board will be looking at prop-
erty – listed as “Field Trip” on 
the agenda.

Adjourned at 9:38am.

BOISE COUNTYBOISE COUNTY

Boise County CommissionersBoise County Commissioners
Transcribed by Eileen Capson

Horseshoe Bend
September 13, 2022
Present: Commissioners 

Steven Twilegar, Clay Tucker, 
and Ryan Stirm via phone.

Pledge of Allegiance
CONSTITUENT INPUT: 

None
MINUTES: Chairman Twi-

legar motioned to approve the 
minutes from September 6th. 
All were in favor and the mo-
tion passed.

ROAD AND BRIDGE: 
Comp time for employees was 
discussed. Curtis Dill said he 
spoke with his employees re-
garding vacation time to be 
taken soon and remaining 
comp time. Chairman Twile-
gar motioned to pay out one 
hundred hours of comp time 
for one employee. The motion 
passed.

SHERIFF: Chairman Twi-
legar motioned to approve the 
staffing agreement between 
the Boise County Sheriff’s 
office and 24/7 staffing. This 
was approved.

LEGAL SERVICE 
AGREEMENT: Commis-
sioner Twilegar motioned to 

adopt a legal service agree-
ment between Boise County 
and a company that handles 
conflict litigation. Clerk Prisco 
said that they have been good 
to work with. There were all 
ayes and the motion passed.

VETERAN’S PARK: 
Commissioner Twilegar spoke 
concerning the Idaho City Vet-
eran’s Park and Resolution 
2022-31 to transfer land from 
Boise County to Idaho City 
Historical Foundation. Pros-
ecutor Adam Strong asked 
that they table this, “to be on 
the safe side” and have it first 
drafted in the newspaper. The 
resolution will be tabled.

RESOLUTION 2022-32: 
Twilegar motioned to increase 
the 2022 Sheriff’s Vessel Fund 
for unanticipated expenses. 
Clerk Mary Prisco said it was 
part of the 2021 annual report, 
and the new truck needed for 
the vessel program. She said, 
“This is just amending the 
budget for that.” Twilegar 
again motioned to adopt Reso-
lution 2022-32 to increase the 
Sheriff’s Vessel Fund for un-
anticipated expenses. The bud-
get was $39,197 and increases 
$49,523, and the amended 
budget is $88,720 for the new 
vehicle for towing the vessel. 
This was seconded by Com-
missioner Tucker and passed.

EMERGENCY MANAG-

ER: Additional funds with no 
match were discussed. Com-
missioner Twilegar motioned 
to receive the additional funds 
from the Idaho Office of Emer-
gency Management for 2020 
grant in the amount $13,885. 
All were in favor and the mo-
tion carried.

CATERING PERMIT: 
Commissioner Twilegar mo-
tioned to approve a catering 
permit for a wedding. This 
was approved.

CLAIMS APPROVAL: 
Chairman Twilegar motioned 
to approve the claims approval 
for $366,173. All were in favor 
and the motion was approved.

FIELD TRIP: Commis-
sioner Twilegar spoke about 
the field trip, “We’re seriously 
considering the long-term fu-
ture and these buildings, and 
the fact that it seems like every 
month that we’re replacing an 
HVAC unit in all. In all, these 
buildings are awesome, but in 
the future, it would be nice to 
have everybody in one build-
ing. Maybe the sheriff on one 
level, and hopefully pay for 
all that with grant money.” 
Prosecutor Strong referred to 
a 20-acre lot that they will be 
exploring on September 20th, 
and may consider doing a land 
swap with the state land near 
the baseball field.

Adjourned at 9:33am.
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New District Ranger for Idaho CityNew District Ranger for Idaho City

Homecoming Court for Garden Valley High SchoolHomecoming Court for Garden Valley High School

Tacoma Kelly & Kadence Jacobs - Junior court Trevor Corn & Aubree Zimmer - Sophomore court Maxon Yearsley & Lacey Tucker - Freshman court

Bryce Smith & Grace Thompson - Senior courtPhotos courtesy of Heidi Van Dyk

Idaho City District Ranger 
selected Josh Newman, pro-
moted from within the Boise 
National Forest

BOISE COUNTY — Boise 
National Forest Supervisor 
Tawnya Brummett is pleased 
to welcome Josh Newman as 
the new Idaho City District 
Ranger. “Josh is a valuable 
member of the Boise National 
Forest family,” said Brummett. 
“He has worked on a variety 
of complex forest projects and 
has strong relationships in our 
communities. I am delighted 
that he is continuing to share 
his love for the land and enthu-
siasm to work with our part-
ners as the Idaho City District 
Ranger.”

Newman has worked for the 
Forest Service in various field 
forester positions for the last 
18 years. He worked on mul-
tiple national forests includ-
ing the Sawtooth, Gunnison, 
Medicine Bow, Kaibab, and 
ultimately landed in the Boise 
National Forest in 2008. Josh 
has an extensive background 
in timber and silverculture and 
recently served in a temporary 
Deputy Ranger position for the 
Sawtooth National Recreation 

Area in Stanley, Idaho.
“There are few things I enjoy 

more than being in the woods. 
I value bringing specialists to-
gether and working toward 
treatments that benefit wildlife, 
recreation, and other ecosystem 
processes while producing vi-
able timber sales that also re-
lieve the stress of overcrowded 
timber stands,” said Newman. 
“I look forward to working 
with Idaho City’s diverse com-
munity to reach local solutions 
that improve quality of life and 
forest health.”

Josh Newman has been ex-
tremely active as a team lead 
for Boise front range projects. 
For the last four years, Josh has 
led a large reforestation pro-
gram, helping to restore large 
fire scars from the 2016 Pio-
neer Fire, 2013 Pony and Elk 
complexes and has led in plan-
ning reforestation efforts fol-
lowing timber harvests to im-
prove forest resiliency around 
the Bogus Basin area.

Josh Newman was not in the office on Sept. 20, at the time of the 
press release.			   Photo by Eileen Capson
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Solution at the bottom of page 5

Solution found at the bottom of page 7.
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~ continued from page 1

Horseshoe Bend City Council MeetingHorseshoe Bend City Council Meeting

Hosted by the Horseshoe Bend Volunteer Fire Department

The following is a synopsis 
of the Horseshoe Bend City 
Council meeting on September 
14, 2022. Six people were in at-
tendance for the meeting, along 
with two Boise County Sher-
iff Deputies. Three  individu-
als appeared to join in via the 
city’s Zoom link. All council 
members were in attendance. 

Mayor Pat Goff made the call 
to order at 7:00 p.m. and then 
led the Pledge of Allegiance. 
After unanimous approval of 
the agenda, it was determined 
that approval for the minutes 
from the previous meeting, as 
well as the approval of bills to 
pay, was inadvertently left off 
the agenda. Both will be added 
to next month’s agenda. Goff 
opened the meeting with a pub-
lic hearing for the fiscal year 
2022 budget, which had been 
amended. City Treasurer Ter-
rie Nolan told the council that 
two grants were not accounted 
for in the budget, 250K for 
the sidewalks and 86K for the 
ozone generator. The budget 
was republished and with no 
comments for, against, or neu-
tral, the hearing closed at 7:02 
p.m. and the budget was passed 
unanimously without further 
discussion in the  new busi-
ness portion of the meeting. 

Also in new business, the 
representative of the property 
owner residing at 120 River 
Avenue approached the council 
again regarding a zone change 
from residential to C-2 (general 
commercial). While the repre-
sentative stated that they were 
“not here to make waves,” they 
challenged the council to drive 
down River Avenue and look at 
all the other properties that are 
living and conducting business 

on the premises. He described 
the area as “an island of resi-
dential in an industrial park.” 
He stated that he wasn’t ask-
ing for more than all his neigh-
bors currently enjoy and he 
said he feels as though the city 
is discriminating against him. 

City Attorney Tony Pantera 
said that a Planned Unit Devel-
opment (PUD) was the process 
the property owner needed to 
embark upon. City Clerk Gina 
Elmer and Nolan both said 
that the other property owners 
each have two lots, one zoned 
residential and the other zoned 
commercial. He was then told 
that the clearest path would 
be through a lot split with one 
zoned residential and the other 
commercial. The representa-
tive balked at the idea because 
of the costs involved. City En-
gineer Amy Woodruff said that 
the PUD would need an engi-
neer’s report and that the lot 
split would be the most cost 
effective. Goff asked, “Can we 
get this done by next month?” 

Councilmember Curtis Cor-
vinus questioned whether 
anything could be done dur-
ing the meeting to help the 
representive. Woodruff said, 
“Not really.” She added that 
the most expedient meth-
od would be the lot split. 

EMS: No report. 
Public Works: The Depart-

ment of Environmental Quality 
has been active in testing for 
algae bloom and the task has 
been challenging. The pump 
at the new Veteran’s Memo-
rial Park has been completed. 

Grant Writer: Cheryl 
Pleak opened by stating, “The 
Sheriff’s Office gave me 15 
minutes tonight.” Goff came 

back with, “They don’t have 
the authority, three minutes…
now 2:50.” Pleak stated that 
she had applied for a federal 
Parks and Recreation grant 
for the Veteran’s Memorial 
Park that would share infra-
structure expenses 50/50 with 
the city and that she had re-
ceived a $60,000 donation. 

City Engineer: They have 
been supporting Public Works 
with the water quality and 
exploring tank ideas with 
the USDA. They have been 
working on the final details 
for the Deer Valley Subdivi-
sion development agreement 

and indicated that they were 
not anticipating any changes. 

City Attorney: Pantera 
said he was also involved 
with the finalization of the 
Deer Valley Subdivision 
development agreement. 

Mayor Goff said he applied 
for and received a temporary 
permit for the new pump at the 
Veteran’s Memorial Park. Gem 
County and Black Canyon 
have lodged protests against 
the permit, but Goff said that 
it looks like it will go through. 

He then thanked the 
deputies for their atten-
dance at the meeting. 

Councilmember Patti Bur-
gess asked the mayor what the 
new park will look like. Goff 
responded that right now they 
are just trying to get grass and 
parking ready. Burgess said she 
was worried that everything 
would be dug up at a later date 
for a “splash pad.” Goff said that 
the plan right now is to have it 
set up for the planned Veteran’s 
Day event on November 11. 

The council went into ex-
ecutive session at 7:22 p.m. 
to discuss pending litigation. 
Upon their return, the council 
authorized the mayor to ex-
ecute a settlement agreement. 

Reporter's Notes: No men-
tion was made of the actual 
case involved, but court records 
show the city’s only active 
case is against Canyon Street 
MHP, LLC and Jon Dufresne, 
which was filed in July 2021. 

In related news, council 

The Horseshoe Bend City Council gets down to business during their meeting on September 14.
							                                 Photo by Tracy Koslosky

member Curtis Corvinus had 
an amended complaint filed 
against him alleging he took 
$3,668.53 from the Horseshoe 
Bend Fire Department’s Burn 
Out Fund during his tenure as 
the fire chief. The amendment 
upped the charges to felony 
grand theft, asserting that Cor-
vinus took the money with the 
“intent to appropriate to himself 
certain property of another.” 
Corvinus resigned his post as 
fire chief in March of this year, 
but currently retains his seat on 
the city council. If Corvinus is 
convicted of the felony charge, 
he will give up his seat on the 
council. The Constitution of the 
State of Idaho states, “No per-
son is permitted to vote, serve 
as a juror, or hold any civil of-
fice who has, at any place, been 
convicted of a felony, and who 
has not been restored to the 
rights of citizenship, or who, 
at the time of such election, 
is confined in prison on con-
viction of a criminal offense.”

Be First To See Be First To See 
The Idaho The Idaho 

WorldWorld
Online Sub-Online Sub-

scription Everyscription Every
Wednesday at Wednesday at 

9am!9am!
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garden valley volleyballgarden valley volleyball

When Should You Call 911?When Should You Call 911?

The Garden Valley Middle School B Team (6th graders) won their first two sets to secure a win 
over Rimrock on September 13th.			   Photos by Linda Ruppel, DDS

On 9-13-22, Garden Valley Middle School A Team (purple- 7th and 8th graders) fought back hard 
to get the win over Rimrock (green) Middle School A Team.    Photos by Linda Ruppel, DDS
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Annual Robie Creek Fire Fundraiser

SEVERANCE SAND & GRAVEL
       Garden Valley • Lowman

Readymix Concrete • Concrete • Sand • Topsoil • Gravel

         Delivery or U-haul 
We accept Visa & MC  
License # RCE34099

Call 208-462-3005

High Ground Electric
& Construction, Inc.

Professional Work     Sensible Rates*

Full Service Electrical
Contractors

* New Home Wiring
* Remodels
* Service Upgrades
* Free Estimates
--------------------------------------------------
Licensed * Bonded * Insured
Serving Boise County    208-342-0519

Professional Work * Sensible Rates

23 1/2 hour
service

 208-344-0605  *
Licensed*Bonded*Insured

208-342-0519

*Generators
*Remodels
*Service Upgrades
*Free Estimates

Local school districts 
have all announced their 
policies and guidelines for 
Free and Reduced Price 
Meals for the upcoming 
school year & summer.  
Check with your local school 
for more information.

Schools  Announce
Lunch  Policies : 

By Robie Creek Fire 
Chief Nathan Bowers

ROBIE CREEK -- I’d 
like to thank everyone that 
showed up, and give a huge 
shout out to the volunteers 
that worked that day. It is a 
ton of work to put this event 
together, but seeing every-
one show up and have a 
good time makes it all worth 
it. We had another record 
year! The funds generated 
this year will finish updat-
ing our structure gear and 
start replacing our expired 
breathing air cylinders.

For anyone on the fence 
about joining our fire de-
partment, please keep in 
mind that there are so many 
jobs to keep this department 
afloat, that don’t involve run-
ning into a burning building. 
We will find a job that suits 
anyone and helps better the 
department. To apply, visit 
www.robiecreek.org and 
click on the volunteer tab. 
Fill out the application and 
we will reach out to you.

Special thanks to everyone that came out to show their support 
of their local volunteer fire department on September 10th.  

					     Photo by Eileen Capson

Photos courtesy of Phoebe Heideman

Photos courtesy of Phoebe Heideman
Good food, music, and raffle items!
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Schools  Announce

Garden ValleyGarden Valley

Eat				   Drink			   Unwind

Idaho City 
1862 Merch

Over 60 wine selections and 30 ice cold beer options
Ask about the $1 stage area rental program for your next event

Extra Lean 

Half Pound 

Burgers

Burritos & 

  Tacos
Fresh 

Seafood

NightlyDinner Specials!

Fine Art

204 Main Street, Idaho City  208.392.9334
lisa@bocosocial.com

Fall HoursFall Hours
Thursday thru SundayThursday thru Sunday  

Noon to 9pmNoon to 9pm

boise county boise county 
sheriff's officesheriff's office

Record of eventsRecord of events

New Construction, 
Remodels and Repairs

Licensed and Insured
208-899-9404

Records 09/01-09/11/2022

Nature of Call:

9l1 Hangup 1
Abandoned Vehicle 5
Accidental Shooting 1
Off Hwy Veh Accident 1
Traflic Accident w/ Damage 

4
Traflic Accident w/ Injuries 

4 
Agency Assistance 3
Alarm Residence 1
Animal at Large 2
Animal Complaint 1
Animal Cruelty 1
Animal on Road/Hwy 3 
Vicious Animal 2
Assault Aggravated 1
Child Abuse or Neglect 1
Citizen Complaint 13
Civil Complaint 1
Civil Process Service 1
Disturbing the Peace 2
DUI Alcohol or Drugs 2
Extra Patrol 2
Fire 3
Fire Closed Season 4
Fire Unattended 1
Fire Unknown 1
Fire Vehicle 1
Fireworks 1
Fraud 1
Health & Welfare 1
Harassment 4
Hospice Death 1
Information Report 1
Intoxicated Person 1

Medical Emergency 15
Assist Motorist 9
No Contact Order Viola-

tion1
Overdue Person 1
Fire Pager Test 10
Powerline Down 1
Public Assist 2
Public Contact 3 
Reckless Driver 9
Shots Fired 2
Special Event 2
Special Location 3
Suicidal Subject 3
Suspicious Person/Circum-

stance 7
Theft 5 
Vehicle Theft 1 
Threatening 1 
Traffic Hazard 3
Traffic Violation 2
Traffic Stop 124
Trespassing 3 
Unattended Death 1
VIN Serial Number Inspec-

tion 4
Welfare Check 2
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Located on the Boardwalk next 
to the historic Boise Basin Merc

307 Main Street

Realtor on Site with Victory Realty
Years of Client Service Experience

BUYING OR
SELLING IN 

BOISE COUNTY?

“Let me help you with all 
your real estate needs!”

Going the Extra Mile!
Available 7 Days a Week • Local

LEGAL NOTICESLEGAL NOTICES

Curious chipmunk.			   Photo by Eileen Capson
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Family AdvocatesFamily Advocates
Volunteers NeededVolunteers Needed

HSB Varsity FootballHSB Varsity Football

Call 208-259-3326
MP 84, Hwy. 21, Lowman

Restaurant,
Motel, Cabin,

Gasoline,
RV Park, Liquor Store

Hours: 
Open 7 Days A Week

Sourdough Lodge

Garbage Service to most of 
Boise County. We also have 
Construction & Demo Con-

tainers. Call for pricing.
Locally Owned for 40 Years!

208-793-2561

BOISE COUNTY -- The 
Family Advocates Court 
Appointed Special Advo-
cate (CASA) program is 
looking for volunteers to be-
come Guardians ad Litem! 
Our mission is to strengthen 
families and keep kids safe 
by empowering everyday 
people to protect and enrich 
the lives of youth. In doing 
this we can create a stronger, 
healthier, and happier com-
munity.

A Guardian ad Litem 
(GAL) is a trained volunteer 
appointed by a judge to ad-
vocate for the best interests 
of an abused, neglected, or 
abandoned child. These vol-
unteers spend time with the 
child at least once per month 
during scheduled or un-
scheduled visits, they speak 
with anyone who knows 
the child; family members, 
teachers, physicians, and 
social workers, and they re-
view records and informa-
tion pertaining to the child. 
They provide a report to the 
judge using the information 
they gather and are repre-
sented in court by a pro bono 
attorney that works with the 
4th Judicial District CASA 
Program.

Children with a CASA 
volunteer supporting them 
are less likely to re-enter 
the foster care system and 
more likely to find a perma-
nent home that is safe, ei-
ther through reunification or 
adoption. Additionally, they 
are more likely to have bet-
ter psychological wellbeing, 

improved academic perfor-
mance, and positive social 
relationships.

The Family Advocates 
CASA program operating 
in Ada, Elmore, Boise, and 
Valley counties is currently 
in need of 75 new Guard-
ians ad Litem and 25 pro 
bono attorneys. In the last 
year, the number of chil-
dren in these counties be-
ing served by the CASA 
program has increased by 
10.2%. Currently, the major-
ity of these children, 89%, 
are Ada County cases, 10% 
are Elmore County cases, 
and 1% composes Boise and 
Valley County cases. To vol-
unteer as a GAL you must 
be at least 21 years old and 
able to pass a criminal his-
tory check through the Idaho 
Supreme Court. Volunteers 
are trained and supported 
throughout their case by the 
CASA team.

Find out more at our vir-
tual Volunteer Information 
Hour! Sign up by emailing 
us at volunteer@familyad-
vocates.org, or learn more 
online at https://familyadvo-
cates.org/casa/

By Tracy Koslosky
HORSESHOE BEND -- The 

Horseshoe Bend Mustang Varsity 
Football team took their first loss 
of the season in a pick up game on 
Friday, September 16. The team 
traveled to Fairfield to play the 
Camas County Mushers in a non-
conference battle. With a final 
score of 6-54, the Mustangs only 
scored once in the second quarter. 
The team plays the Council Lum-
berjacks in Council on Friday, 
September 23. Kick off is at 7:00 
p.m. Pictured: #7 Junior Kaelun 
Jones tries to avoid a defensive 
player from Camas County High 
School. 

Horseshoe Bend junior Gavin 
Tomlinson (right) is on the receiv-
ing end of a pass from junior quar-
terback Carson Drake as a Camas 
County Musher attempts to take 
him down during the Mustang's 
6-54 loss in Fairfield on Septem-
ber 16.

Images courtesy of Kristi Miller
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What if HE knows something you don’t?What if HE knows something you don’t?
He gives us what we need –believe!He gives us what we need –believe!

       “Believe”              - Blessing Offor         “Believe”              - Blessing Offor  

 Offering Weekly 
Pickups/ Scheduled 

Junk Haul-offs
Dump Trailers 

Available

Proudly Serving East Boise County

bocosan@outlook.com
Still Gluten Free! No MSG Added.

Idaho City's
RV Dump Site

will be out
 of service until 
further notice.

terryp059@gmail.com

•• UNDERSTANDING MEDICARE ••
New to Medicare and feeling overwhelmed?• 
Not sure which plan is right for you?• 
Do you even need Medicare or can you • 
keep what you have now?

We can answer these questions and many 
more at no cost to you.  Call today for your 

free consultation and sleep better tonight.

Call for a FREE CONSULTATION to see which 
plan is right for you! CarrieAnne Kowalczyk

carrieanne@ptibidaho.com

Personal Touch Insurance & Benefits

208-350-9933
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Call for a FREE CONSULTATION to see which 
plan is right for you! CarrieAnne Kowalczyk

carrieanne@ptibidaho.com
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•• UNDERSTANDING MEDICARE ••
New to Medicare and feeling overwhelmed?• 
Not sure which plan is right for you?• 
Do you even need Medicare or can you • 
keep what you have now?

We can answer these questions and many 
more at no cost to you.  Call today for your 

free consultation and sleep better tonight.

Call for a FREE CONSULTATION to see which 
plan is right for you! CarrieAnne Kowalczyk

carrieanne@ptibidaho.com

Personal Touch Insurance & Benefits

208-350-9933

Local Independent Insurance Agent for Idaho City
      A one-stop-shop for your medicare options
“I am a Local independent insurance agent that can represent many insurance companies.”

Two locations Boise and Idaho City

 

Office 
Open Daily 

 
Mon. - Sun. 

8:00am - 5:00pm 
 
 
 

Restaurant 
 

Sun. - Thurs. 
8am - 9pm 
Fri. & Sat. 
7am - 10pm 

 
 
 

Golf Shop 
 

7:30am - 7:00pm 
 

Pavilion 
 

Fri. - Sun. 
10am-Close 

Hot Springs 
Pool 

 
Open Daily & to 

Public 
 

Mon. - Thurs. 
10am-10pm 
Fri. & Sat. 
 9am-10pm 

Sun. 
 9am-8pm 

 
 
 
 

Lounge 
 

Mon. - Thurs. 
12pm-Close 
Fri. - Sun. 

10am-Close 
 

101 Holiday Drive, Garden Valley, ID  83722 
Office:  462-3250  Pro Shop: 462-3314 

Golfing season is in full force now. Our newly remod-
eled geothermal pool and its surrounding area is com-
pleted and looks beautiful. It’s time to plan a fun time 

for golf and swimming and just plain relaxing.  We 
have motel rooms, cabins and condos to rent if you 

want to stay over.  Call the office at 208-462-3250 or 
book online at terracelakes.com.   

 
The Wine and Art Festival will be on June 25th.  We 

have many vendors, wine distributors and food trucks 
that will be here.  Come on up and enjoy. 

We have our new menu now with nightly dinner specials. We 
still have BBQ ribs on Friday nights and Prime Rib on   

Saturday nights.   
 

We are also open every day for Breakfast, which is served 
until 11:00 am 

We are located 3 miles north of Crouch up the Middle 
Fork Road off Warm Springs Road. 

 

Horseshoe Bend Varsity VolleyballHorseshoe Bend Varsity Volleyball

SSee ya at the Merc on Sundayee ya at the Merc on Sunday
and we’ll talk about all God has for usand we’ll talk about all God has for us

Mountain Life MinistriesMountain Life Ministries  
Idaho City 10:00Idaho City 10:00

By Tracy Koslosky
HORSESHOE BEND -- The Horseshoe Bend Junior Varsity Mustangs fell to the Meadows Val-

ley Varsity Mountaineers at home on Wednesday, September 14. 
Pictured from left to right: Freshman Erika McKee, freshman Hailey Gorbet, freshman Kinzee 

Ranft, junior Jullian Wellan, freshman Alyssa Bladen (with the return), and freshman Lyndee Gra-
ham. 

The JV team is at home against Tri Valley on September 20 and in Council on Friday, September 
23 at 3:30 p.m. They're back at home on Monday, September 26 with first service at 6:00 p.m. be-
fore traveling to New Meadows on Wednesday, September 28 with a game time of 6:00 p.m.

Horseshoe Bend vs Meadow Valley on September 14th. 		  Photo by Tracy Koslosky

PHILANTHROPISTS NEEDED
Two opportunities to support Boise County.  

Funds are needed to supply emergency life 
saving equipment for our officers.  Another 
is to fund a public access space for future 
generations. If you have interest in donating 
and making a legacy for Boise County, please 
contact Bryce at 208-258-1793.
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City Council Meeting in Idaho CityCity Council Meeting in Idaho City

Mayor Everhart administers Oath of Office to Ryan Heffington.              Photo by Georgene Thomas

Complete City Council Members:  Ryan Heffington, Ashley M. Elliott, Mari Adams, Tom Secor, and Mayor Ken Everhart.                                  Photo by Georgene Thomas

By Georgene Thomas 
IDAHO CITY -- The Idaho 

City Regular Council meeting 
of September 14, 2022 was 
called to order at 6:00 p.m. 
Those present were Mayor 
Everhart, Councilmembers 
Tom Secor, Ashley M. Elliott, 
and Mari Adams.  After the 
minutes were approved, Mayor 
Everhart decided to administer 
the oath of office to the new 
member, Ryan Heffington, so 
he could join the council and 
finish out the 4-year term of 
David Martin. 

The bills/payable were ap-
proved from August 25, 
through September 14, 2022, 
in the amount of $62,174.62.  

The checklist for Mike Tam 
– “Java the Pup Celebration of 
Life” party was approved with 
a contingency on insurance.  
This will be held between noon 
and        6 p.m. on the block of 
Main Street in front of Harley’s 
pub, Councilmember Secor 
made a motion to approve an 
alcohol variance for that time.  

The Engineers report was 
given by Mike Woodworth with 
Mountain Waters, he updated 
the council on the situation 
with the current water rights 
procurement.  At this time, they 
have not found anything to pur-
chase, but perhaps a long-term 
lease for the 1861 water right.  
There is also an option to be 
annexed into the Nampa/Me-
ridian Irrigation District and 
use the water rights during ir-

~ continued on page 13

rigation season.  Council felt 
that it would be better to try to 
move forward with the lease 
option until the City could pur-
chase a permanent water right.  
The water system facility plan 
is underway, a task order was 
provided for council review re-
garding the sand separator for 
the RO system and will be on 
the next agenda for approval.

Under old business, Super-
intendent Brian Hunicke from 
the Idaho High School asked 
for permission to use the build-
ing materials across from the 
City Shop to erect an indoor 
community sports facility.  
Public Works director Tami 
Claus did not have time to val-
ue the items for the structure. 
It was discussed, and Council 
believed the items were around 
$3,000.00.  It was determined 
that a resolution would be 
needed to donate the surplus 
materials to the school with an 
attachment fully describing the 
materials.  This will be put on 
the next agenda as an action 
item.  In the meantime, if the 
school needs to get measure-
ments for future construction, 
they are free to do so.  

A propane proposal was giv-
en by Shane McConnel from 
Valley Wide Propane, he pre-
sented the plan of action to get 
the propane transferred over to 
Valley Wide and get the City 
Hall propane generator hooked 
up soon.  He will work with 
Clerk Ptak and Public works 

director Tami Claus to organize 
a time to get the propane tanks 
emptied and set up new ones. 

There was a discussion of 
the Idaho City Fire Protection 
District and the transfer of land 
deed.  Clerk Ptak gave Coun-
cil a written timeline of the fire 
station from the beginning and 
Idaho City’s involvement in 
the building.  The Council has 
never said that they intended to 
evict the fire department from 
that building, that was a mes-
sage that came up on social 
media and it is entirely false.  
At the time that the building 
was built, it was done with fun-
draisers, volunteers, and dona-
tions from patrons who wanted 
a Volunteer Fire Department in 
Idaho City.  The City let them 
build on “City” property and 
have paid all the taxes, water, 
and sewer since.

Specific discussion was: "No 
one in our City Council wants 
to kick the fire district out. No 
one wants to hand it over with-
out a fair trade to the City. It is 
beneficial to Idaho City to keep 
it and continue to lease it to the 
Fire District.  If and when, the 
Fire District outgrows the need 
for this facility, the City would 
be able to use it for other uses. 
At this time, we will table this, 
until the City Council has been 
approached by the Idaho City 
Fire District with a proposal for 
us to consider.”

Regarding the approval 

of CLG grant bills for the 
Idaho Heritage Conference,  
Rhonda Jameson was not able 
to be present, Clerk Ptak ex-
plained that in the past the 
City was the middleman, so to 
speak, for the CLG grants.  The 
Historical Commission would 
provide the receipts, the City 
would pay them and be reim-
bursed for said receipts.  This 
year, however, it may be more 
of a scholarship, and it has not 
been determined if the City will 
need to be involved financially. 

Ordinance No. 325 and 
Resolution No. 2014-23 Event 
checklist review.  Council-
member Ashley M. Elliott had 
written up some thoughts and 
ideas to add to the Park Usage 
in town, as she is also on the 
Idaho City Historical Founda-
tion.  They are currently updat-
ing their policies for the use of 
the parks and she thought that 
if Idaho City and the histori-
cal Foundation were similar it 
would create a clear under-
standing of what should be 
expected when any of the City 
properties are used for events.  
The City would need to up-
date the current ordinance and 
checklist for events. Council 
will look over the proposal and 
add thoughts and ideas. 

Resolution No 2022-07 – 
Authorizing destruction of 
records.  Clerk Ptak provided 
the council with a few differ-
ent options on how the City 
could safely destroy records.  
The best option was to have 
Amanda Leader, Boise County 
Community Justice Director, 
appoint a community service 
member to shred the documents 
while supervised.  Council and 
City Attorney, Joan Callahan, 
has looked through the list and 
did not see anything that they 
felt needed to come out. Items 
of any significance have been 
scanned and the city has an 
electronic copy of the docu-
ments.  Councilmember Secor 
made a motion to approve Res-
olution 2022-07 authorizing 
the destruction of records and 
allow Amanda Leader from 

Community Justice to provide 
the means of the destruction of 
the documents. This was sec-
onded by Elliott and all coun-
cilmembers agreed. 

There was an Executive ses-
sion and no action was taken. 

Public works Director Tami 
Claus updated the City Coun-
cil and introduced new hire 
Chad Sinclair.  She discussed 
the sand bay cleaning, upcom-
ing projects, and the needed 
repairs for the water main line 
in the next few weeks before 
winter freezing takes place in 
the Mores Creek Subdivision 
on Nugget Court. A message 
will need to be sent out to all of 
those affected as the water will 
be temporarily shut off. Once 
the details are resolved, Clerk 
Ptak will post on the website 
and send out letters to those 
customers.  Councilmember 
Heffington will also give the 
same notice to the HOA of Mo-
res Creek. There are at least 5 
services that will be directly 
affected, but more could possi-
bly be without water for a short 
period of time as the line gets 
buried deeper. 

Under Law Enforcement, 
Clerk Ptak gave an update for 
Chief Otter. They have fin-
ished the first overtime grant 
and the City should see reim-
bursement soon. The grant for 
two electronic speed signs is 
underway. A grant for e-tickets 
and tough books for the police 
vehicles is also underway. The 
police force has been busy with 
citations. They have also been 
dealing with people taking 
water from private and public 
areas and have informed some 
of the public areas to lock their 
outside facets. They will con-
tinue to monitor.

Clerk Ptak presented the 
council with an application and 
contract for city water and/or 
sewer services for them to con-
sider. The current ordinance 
would need to be amended to 
reflect any deposit over 50 dol-
lars. This could be beneficial to 
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A FULL-SERVICE LAW FIRMA FULL-SERVICE LAW FIRM
Wills, Probate, Guardianships, Business, Real Estate

Davis & WalkerDavis & Walker
Frank WalkerFrank Walker

11 Market Street, Garden Valley, ID 8362211 Market Street, Garden Valley, ID 83622
(208) 462-6388(208) 462-6388

frankwalker@boiselaw.netfrankwalker@boiselaw.net

GARDNER 
CONSTRUCTION

208-392-4576
Road Construction, 

Gravel, Roadmix, Sewer 
Installation, House 

Pads, etc.

BOISE COUNTYBOISE COUNTY

Mountain Properties For Sale
      Lots from 1 - 40 Acres in Boise County
   Terms - 10% down and 1% per month.

We also have property in Adams Co.
in larger parcels on the Middle Fork of Weiser

about 20 miles from Tamarack Resort.

For current list call: (208) 331-7929

LEGAL NOTICESLEGAL NOTICES

GARDEN VALLEY QUILTERS OFFER BEGINNING CLASSGARDEN VALLEY QUILTERS OFFER BEGINNING CLASS
  
The Garden Valley Quilters are offering a beginning quilting class this year, open 

to anyone interested in learning this fun and rewarding hobby.  In addition to the 
beginning class, the quilters have planned several educational and social events for 
the coming year.

The Quilters meet the second and fourth Wednesdays at the Garden Valley Senior 
Center, and invite all quilters and sewists to join them.  Setup at the GVSC is 9:30 
and the meeting begins at 10:00.  Bring your lunch.

The beginning quilting classes will begin on Wednesday, September 28.  For more 
information about the beginning class, contact Gretchen at 462-4028.  

See the Idaho World 
FIRST on Wednesday 
morning after 9am 
with an online sub-
scription. Go to ida-
howorld.com to sub-
scribe -- only $30!

City Council City Council 
Meeting in Meeting in 
Idaho CityIdaho City

~ continued from page 12

those who are constantly late 
on payments and to give any 
new residents a clear picture 
of what is required for them to 
have services. Council has re-
viewed the past due accounts.  
At the next Council meeting, 
adjustments and a few other 
questions regarding usage will 
be presented. 

Clerk Ptak will be attend-
ing a “clerks” conference next 
week and will have the city 
laptop with her to keep on 
items as needed. She will post 
the next agenda from out of 
town, if council or mayor have 
anything they want or need she 
has asked them to email her.

Councilmember Secor asked 
about the generator that was de-
livered at the RO site, he stated 
that he would be willing to 
help with placement and needs 
to know the time.  Sam Aarons 
has been finishing up with the 
Stamp Mill and it should be in 
place soon.

Mayor Everhart had an up-
date regarding Parks and Rec-
reation.  He explained that Ida-
ho State Parks and Recreation 
may have found money to help 
the City obtain the BLM prop-
erty.  Councilmember Secor 
will get more information and 
investigate this further.  

Meeting adjourned at 7:45.

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION 

OF IDAHO CITY
The Planning and Zoning Commis-
sion of Idaho City will hold 
a public hearing on Thursday, 
October 6, 2022, beginning at 
6:00 p.m. at City Hall, 511 Main 
Street, Idaho City, ID 83631 
pursuant to Section 10-4-2.E of 
the City Code of Idaho City. The 
purpose of this Public Hearing 
is to take testimony regarding 
the proposed residential zon-
ing of land upon annexation of 
a parcel of property (Parcel 
No. RP06N05E266658) located at 
3889 Hwy 21, Idaho City, Idaho 
that is currently vacant and a 
related zoning map amendment 
to include the property.
The full annexation descrip-
tion and application is avail-
able for inspection at the 
City Hall or can be forwarded 
electronically upon request. 
Written comments may be sub-
mitted for consideration by 
no later than 5:00 p.m. on 
Wednesday October 5, 2022. 
Members of the public may also 
provide testimony at the Pub-
lic Hearing.
Any person needing special 
accommodations to participate 
in the above noticed meeting 
must contact the office of the 
City Clerk at 208-392-4584 at 
least two (2) days prior to 
the Public Hearing.

Published in the Idaho World 
on September 21, 2022.

NOTICE OF INVITATION FOR SNOW 
REMOVAL BIDS FOR THE CITY OF 

CROUCH

The City of Crouch will be ac-
cepting snow removal bids for 
the season of 2022-2023, for 
snow removal around Crouch City 
Hall and The Community Hall.
Bids will be accepted from Sep-
tember 15th at 10:00 am until 
October 15th at 4:00pm. All 
bids should be mailed to the 
City of Crouch at 342 Village 
Circle, Garden Valley, Idaho 
83622. The bids should clearly 
outline the hourly rate for 
each function to be performed. 
It would be best to view the 
areas to be plowed before sub-
mitting a bid.
Proof of Liability Insurance 
and Workman’s Compensation In-
surance must be provided prior 
to entering a contract with 
the City of Crouch. The City 
Council reserves the right to 
select the bidder they believe 
to provide the best value and 
is not required to select the 
lowest bidder. For bid details, 
please contact Bonnie at City 
Hall (208) 462-4687.

Published in the Idaho World 
on 9/21, 9/28, 10/5 and 
10/12/2022.

LEGAL NOTICELEGAL NOTICE

Published in the Idaho World on September 21, 2022.
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Obituaries are a free service 
to Boise County residents, as 
part of the Idaho World's com-
mitment to the community. 

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that 
on 01/12/2023 at the hour of  
9:00 AM of said day, at Boise 
County Courthouse Annex the 
Trustee will sell at public 
auction to the highest bidder, 
for cash in lawful money of the 
United States of America, all 
payable at the time of sale, 
the following described real 
property situated in the County 
of Boise, State of Idaho, and 
described as follows, to-wit:

Lot 1, Block 2, Gold Hill 
Subdivision, according to the 
official plat thereof, filed as 
Instrument No. 75756, records 
of Boise County, Idaho.

The Seller has no knowledge of 
a more particular description 
of the above described real 
property, but for purposes 
of compliance with Idaho Code 
Section 60-113, the Trustee 
has been informed that the 
street address of  101 Placer 
St, Idaho City, ID 83631, may 
sometimes be associated with 
said real property.

Said sale will be made, with-
out covenant or warranty 
regarding title, possession 
or encumbrances, to satisfy 
the obligation secured by 
and pursuant to the power of 
sale conferred in the Deed of 
Trust made and entered into on 
06/24/2016, by and among Dale 
Rutter, an unmarried man, as 
Grantor, and Alliance Title & 
Escrow Corp., as Trustee, and 
Mortgage Electronic Registra-
tion Systems, Inc. as nominee 
for Direct Mortgage, Corp., 
as Beneficiary; said Deed of 
Trust having been filed of re-
cord on 06/27/2016 as Doc No. 
251219, Official Records of 
Boise County, Idaho.  The nam-
ing of the above Grantor(s) is 
done to comply with Idaho Code 
Section 45-1506(4)(a); no rep-
resentation is made as to the 
responsibility of Grantor(s) 
for this obligation. 

The default for which the sale 
is to be made is that Grantor(s) 
have failed to pay one or more  
monthly installment payments 
under a deed of trust note 
dated 06/24/2016, secured by 
the above mentioned Deed of 
Trust, together with accruing 
late charges, plus any other 
charges lawfully due under 
the note, deed of trust, and 
Idaho law.

The balance owing as of 
09/01/2022 on the obligation 
secured by said Deed of Trust 
is the amount of $81,982.65; 
plus service charges, late 
charges, and any other costs 
or expenses associated with 
this foreclosure as provided 
by the Deed of Trust or Deed 
of Trust Note, or by Idaho law.

Dated this 26 day of August, 
2022.
Brian G Sayer

Published in the Idaho World on 
9/14, 9/21, 9/28 and 10/5/2022.

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
LEGAL NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 
that the Boise County Board of 
Commissioners will hold a Pub-
lic Hearing for the opening of 
the FY 2022 budget on Monday, 
September 26th, 2022 at 10:00 
a.m. in the Miner’s Exchange 
Building, 420 Main Street, 
Idaho City.  All interested 
persons are invited to attend 
this meeting. Special accom-
modations for persons with 
disabilities will be provided 

upon advance request to the 
Clerk’s office at 208-392-4431.  
Mary T. Prisco, Clerk to the 
Board

Published in the Idaho World, 
September 14th, and September 
21st, 2022.

NOTICE OF DIRECTOR ELECTION

Notice is hereby given of elec-
tion for Director of the Nampa & 
Meridian Irrigation District, 
to be held on Tuesday, the 8th 
day of November 2022, at which 
election there will be elected 
one (1) Director for Precinct 
No. 3 of the District.

Such Director will be elected 
to serve a full three (3) year 
term excepting that, in ac-
cord with Title 43-201A of the 
Idaho Code “If, pursuant to 
section  43-201, Idaho Code, 
the secretary of the district 
verifies that there is only one 
(1) qualified candidate who has 
been nominated for the posi-
tion of director to be filled, 
it shall not be necessary to 
hold an election for that 
position, and the board of 
directors shall declare such 
candidate elected as director 
at the next regularly sched-
uled board meeting following 
the expiration of the date for 
filing written nominations.”

ELECTION PRECINCTS SHALL BE 
AS FOLLOWS:

PRECINCT NO. 1 (Boise/Perkins)  
shall consist of all that por-
tion of the territory of the 
District lying East of the 
North and South line passing 
between Sections 4 and 5, Town-
ship 3 North, Range 1 East of 
the Boise Meridian, extending 
through said District.

PRECINCT NO. 2 (Meridian)  shall 
consist of all that portion of 
the District lying between the 
North and South line passing 
between Sections 4 and 5, Town-
ship 3 North, Range 1 East of 
the Boise Meridian, extending 
through the District and the 
North and South line passing 
between Sections 4 and 5, Town-
ship 3 North, Range 1 West of 
the Boise Meridian, extending 
through the District.

PRECINCT NO. 3 (Nampa)  shall 
consist of all that portion of 
the territory of the District 
lying West of the North and 
South line passing between 
Sections 4 and 5, Township 3 
North, Range 1 West of the Boise 
Meridian, extending through 
the District.

VOTING PLACES FOR EACH PRECINCT 
SHALL BE:

Precinct No. 1:
HORIZON ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
730 N Mitchell Street
Boise, ID 83704

Precinct No. 2:
MERIDIAN MIDDLE SCHOOL
1507 W. 8th Street
Meridian, ID    83642

Precinct No. 3:
NAMPA CITY HALL
411 3rd Street South
Nampa, ID 83651

The polls will be open on 
Tuesday, the 8th day of No-
vember 2022, at 8:00 a.m. and 
will close at 8:00 p.m. of the 
same day.

No advance registration will 
be necessary nor required, but 
as required by Title 43 of 

the Idaho Code, Section 113, 
as amended, “…the judges of 
election shall require every 
elector to subscribe to an 
elector’s oath as a prerequi-
site to casting his vote, and 
such oath shall be the usual 
elector’s oath with the fol-
lowing words added thereto, 
‘and I own land within the 
____________________ irriga-
tion district, and am a resident 
of the county within which the 
district, or a portion thereof 
is located’.”  This oath re-
quires that each applicant for 
a ballot certify that he or she 
owns land within the boundar-
ies of the Nampa & Meridian 
Irrigation District; that he 
or she is a resident of either 
Ada, Boise, or Canyon County 
and that he or she possesses 
all the qualifications required 
of electors of the State of 
Idaho by the general election 
laws thereof.

In compliance with Title 43 
Section 201 of the Idaho Code, 
as amended, nominations for 
the office of Director must be 
filed with the Secretary of the 
District not less than forty 
(40) days nor more than sixty 
(60) days before the date of 
the election.  “Candidates for 
election to the office of direc-
tor of an irrigation district 
shall be nominated by nominat-
ing petitions on forms provided 
by the district”.

This notice of election is 
made in compliance with and 
by authority stated in Title 
43 Section 206 of the Idaho 
Code, as amended.

Michael Comeskey, Secretary of 
the District
Nampa, Idaho

Published in the Idaho World 
on 9/14 and 9/21/2022. 

NOTICE OF TRUSTEE’S SALE - To 
be sold for cash at a Trustee’s 
Sale on January 26, 2023, 09:00 
AM at the Front Steps, Boise 
County Courthouse Annex, 383 
Highway 55, Horseshoe Bend, ID 
83629, the following described 
real property situated in Boise 
County, State of Idaho (“Real 
Property”): Lot 7 in Block 1 
of Duquette Pines Division No. 
1, according to the Official 
Plat thereof, filed May 31, 
1979 as Instrument No. 76381, 
records of Boise County, Idaho 
Commonly known as: 11 Blue 
Jay Way, Idaho City, ID 83631 
Christopher A. Hock, as Trus-
tor conveyed Real Property 
via a Trust Deed dated June 
18, 2016, in favor of Mort-
gage Electronic Registration 
Systems, Inc., as Beneficiary, 
as nominee for Evergreen Mon-
eysource Mortgage Company, 
its successors and assigns as 
Beneficiary, in which Alliance 
Title & Escrow Corp. was named 
as Trustee. The Trust Deed 
was recorded in Boise County, 
Idaho, on June 24, 2016, as 
Instrument No. 251186, of Of-
ficial Records. The Deed of 
Trust was assigned for value 
as follows: Assignee: U.S. Bank 
National Association, not in 
its individual capacity but 
solely as trustee for RMTP 
Trust, Series 2021 Cottage-
TT-V Assignment Dated: May 3, 
2022 Assignment Recorded: June 
1, 2022 Assignment Recording 
Information: Instrument No. 
279669 Shelly M. Casares is 
the Successor Trustee pursuant 
to a Substitution of Trustee 
recorded in the office of the 
Clerk and Recorder of Boise, 
State of Idaho on August 24, 
2022 at Instrument No. 280581, 
of Official Records. The Benefi-

ciary has declared a default 
in the terms of said Deed of 
Trust due to Trustor failure 
to make monthly payments be-
ginning March 1, 2021, and 
each month subsequent, which 
monthly installments would 
have been applied on the prin-
cipal and interest due on said 
obligation and other charges 
against the property or loan.  
By reason of said default, the 
Beneficiary has declared all 
sums owing on the obligation 
secured by said Trust Deed 
immediately due and payable.  
The total amount due on this 
obligation is the principal 
sum of $218,886.71, interest 
in the sum of $18,667.23, es-
crow advances of $10,645.95, 
other amounts due and payable 
in the amount of $2,598.59, 
for a total amount owing of 
$250,798.48, plus accruing 
interest, late charges, and 
other fees and costs that may 
be incurred or advanced. The 
Beneficiary anticipates and may 
disburse such amounts as may be 
required to preserve and pro-
tect the property and for real 
property taxes that may become 
due or delinquent, unless such 
amounts of taxes are paid by 
the Trustor.  If such amounts 
are paid by the Beneficiary, 
the amounts or taxes will be 
added to the obligations se-
cured by the Deed of Trust.  
Other expenses to be charged 
against the proceeds of this 
sale include the Trustee’s fees 
and attorney’s fees, costs and 
expenses of the sale, and late 
charges, if any. Beneficiary 
has elected, and has directed 
the Trustee to sell the above 
described property to satisfy 
the obligation. The sale is a 
public sale and any person, 
including the Beneficiary, may 
bid at the sale.  The bid price 
must be paid immediately upon 
the close of bidding by certi-
fied funds (valid money orders, 
certified checks or cashier’s 
checks).  The conveyance will 
be made by Trustee’s Deed, 
without any representation or 
warranty, including warranty 
of title, express or implied, 
as the sale is made strictly 
on an as-is, where-is basis, 
without limitation, the sale 
is being made subject to all 
existing conditions, if any, 
of lead paint, mold or other 
environmental or health haz-
ards. The Trustor, successor 
in interest to the Trustor, 
or any other person having an 
interest in the property, or 
any person named in IRC § 45-
1506, has the right, at any 
time prior to the Trustee’s 
Sale, to pay to the Beneficiary, 
or the successor in interest 
to the Beneficiary, the entire 
amount then due under the Deed 
of Trust and the obligation 
secured thereby (including 
costs and expenses actually 
incurred and attorney’s fees) 
other than such portion of the 
principal as would not then be 
due had no default occurred 
and by curing any other de-
fault complained of herein that 
is capable of being cured by 
tendering the performance re-
quired under the obligation or 
to cure the default, by paying 
all costs and expenses actu-
ally incurred in enforcing the 
obligation and Deed of Trust 
with Successor Trustee’s and 
attorney’s fees.  In the event 
that all defaults are cured the 
foreclosure will be dismissed 
and the foreclosure sale will 
be canceled. The scheduled 
Trustee’s Sale may be post-
poned by public proclamation 
up to 30 days for any reason. 
If the Trustee is unable to 
convey title for any reason, 
the successful bidder’s sole 
and exclusive remedy shall be 
the return of monies paid to 
the Successor Trustee and the 

successful bidder shall have 
no further recourse. The above 
Trustor are named to comply 
with IRC § 45-1506(4)(a).  No 
representation is made that 
they are, or are not, presently 
responsible for this obliga-
tion. This is an attempt to 
collect a debt and any infor-
mation obtained will be used 
for that purpose. Dated this 
16th day of September, 2022. 
Shelly M. Casares Substitute 
Trustee 376 East 400 South, 
Suite 300, Salt Lake City, UT 
84111 Telephone: 801-355-2886 
Office Hours: Mon.-Fri., 8AM-
5PM (MST) File No. ID10621

Published in the Idaho World 
on 9/21, 9/28, 10/5 and 
10/12/2022. 

NOTICE

NAMPA & MERIDIAN IRRIGATION 
DISTRICT WILL END THE IRRIGA-
TION WATER DELIVERY SEASON ON 
28 SEPTEMBER 2022.   IT WILL 
TAKE APPROXIMATELY TWO DAYS 
FOR THE SYSTEM TO DRAIN.

IF YOUR SUBDIVISION IS SERVICED 
BY A PRESSURE IRRIGATION SYSTEM 
OPERATED BY NAMPA & MERIDIAN 
IRRIGATION DISTRICT AND HAS 
A BACKUP WATER SOURCE, YOUR 
HOMEOWNER ASSOCIATION PRESI-
DENT MUST SUBMIT A REQUEST, IN 
WRITING, FOR WATER TO REMAIN 
ON BY NO LATER THAN WEDNESDAY 
OCTOBER 5TH.  

IF YOUR LAND IS IN NAMPA CITY, 
PLEASE CONTACT NAMPA CITY AT     
208-468-5711 FOR DETAIL CON-
CERNING END OF THE IRRIGATION 
SEASON.

GREG CURTIS
WATER SUPERINTENDENT
NAMPA & MERIDIAN IRRIGATION 
DISTRICT
PHONE: 208-466-0663
PUBLICATION DATES: 18 SEPTEM-
BER 2022

Published in the Idaho World 
on September 21, 2022.

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
LEGAL NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN
That the Boise County Board of 
County Commissioners will hold 
Public Hearings on October 11, 
2022 at 11:00 am in the Board of 
County Commissioners Chambers 
in Idaho City regarding PPA 
#2021-001 Daniel Youngwerth 
Partial Plat Amendment, and 
at 11:15 am regarding SUBMP 
#2022-002 Old Mill Acres Minor 
Subdivision. All interested 
persons are invited to attend 
this meeting.  Special accom-
modations for persons with 
disabilities will be provided 
upon advance request to the 
Clerk’s Office 208-392-4431.

Published in the Idaho World 
September 21, 2022 and Septem-
ber 28, 2022.
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FOR SALE:
1987 Polaris Snowmobile
400  Indy.  $300. If interested 

please call  208-919-2650.

Kenmore front end loading 
washing machine, works great, 
$250. Centerville 208-598-2247

Dog kennel chain link, you 
move. Bought at $350 and selling 
for $250. Centerville 208-598-
2247

Yamaha 2000 Mountain Lite 
500 snowmobile, needs a top end, 
$350.  Centerville 208-598-2247

Remington  Rifle. Model 
700LH 30-06, Left Hand Bolt, 
Burris scope 3x9x Fullfield II. 
Comes with Kolpin Case, hard 
case, 2 boxes 180 grain box shells. 
$750. 

Winchester shotgun Model 
1200 auto 20ga. $375. Dick (208) 
859-5096. (9/21)

FOR RENT:
Office/ Business  space avail-

able for rent in Idaho City. 
Located in the Kesler Insurance 
Building on Montgomery St. $500 
a month. Call Jacob Kesler @ 
208-884-3733 or Rachel O'Brien 
@ 208 392-5223.

HELP WANTED:
Gold Mine Gas Station/Kayak 

Pizza  Hiring for all shifts, starting 
wage $13.00/hr  Apply in person

RCVFD Board Secretary po-
sition is open for recruitment! 
Are you looking for a volunteer 
role to support your community? 
Robie Creek Volunteer Fire De-
partment has multiple volunteer 
roles and can use help for many 
tasks. 

The RCVFD Board is seeking 
a secretary to serve on the Board. 
Primary duties of the secretary in-
clude preparing agendas, attend-
ing Board meetings and recording 
minutes. The Board members and 
other volunteers are a very dedi-
cated group. 

Visit the RCVFD website at Ro-
biecreek.org for a volunteer appli-
cation. Private message on Next 
Door or call Mary Jones (208-
385-0212) or any Board member 
if you have questions.

Also, remember to mark your 
calendars for the upcoming 
RCVFD Annual Fundraiser on 
September 10th, 1-5 at the Robie 
Creek Park shelter. See you there!

City of Idaho City is hir-
ing temporary full-time public 
works position that may lead to 
permanent full-time.

Performs a variety of mainte-
nance work and operates a variety 
of equipment in the construction, 
operation, repair, maintenance, 
and replacement of City water, 
sewer, street, and storm drainage 
facilities and systems.

Drives trucks of various sizes 
and weights in the loading, haul-
ing, and unloading of various 
equipment, gravel and sand.  Op-
erates light and medium-sized 
construction and power equip-
ment, such as mechanized broom, 
or backhoe/loader.  

Performs required labor in-
volved in construction and main-

tenance projects as part of a crew, 
including pavement cutting, ditch 
digging, manhole and line clean-
ing, main and pipe repair, laying 
and backfilling.

Required to be on call for emer-
gency work, snowplowing in win-
ter, and any other city emergency 
as required.

Operates a variety of power con-
struction and maintenance equip-
ment used in the water, sewer, and 
street department.

Other duties as upkeep of all 
City property (weeding, mowing).  
May be required to pick up and 
dispose of trash in all City trash 
cans.  Required to do water meter 
readings and return them to the 
City Clerk.  Performs and com-
pletes other duties as assigned.

Full job description and ap-
plications are available at City 
Hall, 511 Main St., Idaho City, Id.  
Mon.-Thu. 8 a.m.-5 p.m.  Applica-
tions will be accepted until posi-
tion is filled.

The City of Idaho City is ac-
cepting applications for a P/T 
or F/T office clerk.  The position 
includes, but is not limited to, as-
sisting the Clerk-Treasurer with 
all office duties, including ac-
counting processes, A/R and A/P, 
utility billings & collections, hu-
man resources, records manage-
ment, cemetery records, preparing 
City Council agenda, and taking 
minutes at City Council meetings.  
Applicant must have knowledge of 
Microsoft Office including Word 
and Excel, excellent customer ser-
vice and communications skills.  
Work requires consistent attention 
to detail and good organizational 
and time management skills. High 
school diploma or GED equiva-
lency required.  Job description 
and applications are available on 
our city website and at City Hall, 
511 Main Street, Idaho City, Ida-
ho, Mon.-Thu., 8 a.m.-4:30 p.m.  
Applications will be accepted un-
til 4:30 p.m. on August 25, 2022.

Boise County Road and 
Bridge Department is currently 
understaffed and looking to fill 
five positions. Due to understaff-
ing, expect delays in road service.  
Garden Valley area currently has 
one part-time employee.  If you, 
or if anyone you know is looking 
for work, please visit the Boise 
County website and go to the em-
ployment tab.

Boise County Roll Clerk Po-
sition opening, located in Idaho 
City, which is approximately a 
45 minute drive from East Boise 
area.  This is a full time position 
(40 hours/week) and will poten-
tially require overtime to meet 
critical deadlines.  This position 
will perform a wide range of du-
ties that support the function of the 
Assessor’s Office.  Qualifications: 
High school diploma or equiva-
lent, excellent computer skill in 
Excel/Microsoft Office products 
and excellent written/oral commu-
nication skills. This position will 
pay up to $16.41/hour, included 
benefits are: Health insurance, 
paid vacation, paid sick time, paid 
holidays and PERSI retirement.  
To apply, submit to cjuszczak@
co.boise.id.us the following: (1) 

a filled out Boise County applica-
tion form; (2) a cover letter; and 
(3) a resume. 

City of Idaho City is accepting 
letters of intent for a vacant City 
Councilmember position. Appli-
cants need to reside in the city lim-
its. Written letters of intent may 
be dropped off at City Hall dur-
ing business hours of Mon-Thur 
8am-4:30pm, mailed to City Hall 
at Box 130, Idaho City, ID 83631 
or emailed to idahocityclerk@
cityofic.org by 4:30pm, Monday, 
August 22, 2022. 

City of Idaho City is accepting 
letters of intent for Planning and 
Zoning Commission positions.

All five positions on the Plan-
ning and Zoning Commission are 
open for application and appoint-
ment. At least three (3) members 
must be residents of the City, and 
up to two (2) members may be res-
idents of the area of the City im-
pact. Please be aware that the City 
intends to take action to stagger 
terms and years of appointment. 
Most positions will be for a term 
of four years. Current, qualified 
members of the Commission may 
apply for re-appointment. 

The Idaho City Planning and 
Zoning Commission is respon-
sible for performing the duties set 
forth in the Local Land Use Plan-
ning Act and City Code and to 
make decisions, subject to appeal 
to City Council, or to make rec-
ommendations to the City Council 
on a wide range of matters of plan-
ning and community development 
including:

 1.   Conditional use permits.
 2.   Variances.
 3.   Appeals from decisions by 

the Planning and Zoning Adminis-
trator regarding building permits.

4.  Review and Amendments to 
the City’s Comprehensive Plan.

Written letters may be dropped 
off at City Hall during business 
hours of Mon-Thur 8am-4:30pm, 
sent to City Hall at Box 130, Idaho 
City, ID 83631 or emailed to ida-
hocityclerk@cityogic.org  . Thank 
you.

Announcing School Board 
Trustee Vacancies and Request-
ing Letters of Interest for Zones 
2 and 4

GVSD School Board is accept-
ing Letters of Interest with legal 
name, address and phone number.

Submit Letter of Interest to 
GVSD Board Clerk Melissa Smith 
at msmith@gvsd.net or at Garden 
Valley School, 1053 Banks Low-
man Rd./ PO Box 710, Garden 
Valley, ID 83622.

Letters of interest must be re-
ceived no later than June 9, 2022 
at 4:00pm. For more information 
regarding zones please go

to www.gvsd.net, Explore, 
Documents, School Board Docu-
ments, District Map.

Boise County Road & Bridge 
Department has an opening for 
a full time Equipment Opera-
tor in the Horseshoe Bend area. 
Benefits include health insurance, 
paid vacation, paid sick time, paid 
holidays and PERSI retirement. 
Application and Job Description 
can be printed from the Boise 

Businesses
Lara Alexander - Real Estate................(208) 869-4644
Anthony Insurance Group - Medicare..(208) 477-7057
Berg Plumbing......................................(208) 899-9404
Billy Bob's Rentals & Event Center.......(208) 462-5262
Boise County Sanitation, LLC...............(208) 488-5908
Castle Mt. Homes - Contractor..............(208) 462-2882
Dave's Welding/Auto Repair..................(208) 392-4270
Donna's Place in Placerville..................(208) 392-9666
Garibaldi Charters.................................(800) 900-4665
Garden Valley Dental.............................(208) 462-2220
Garden Valley Properties.......................(208) 462-4620
Home Boutique......................................(208) 392-5223
High Ground Electric  ...........................(208) 342-0519
Jeannie Kittelmann Realtor...................(208) 703-6307
McDonough Group..(208) 985-6931 or (208) 901-5741
Medicare Benefits.................................(208) 350-9933
Miller Enterprises Trash pick up  ..........(208) 793-2561
Mt. Properties for Sale...........................(208) 331-7929
Rachel O'Brien Realtor..........................(208) 392-5223
Severance Sand & Gravel  ...................(208) 462-3005
Sourdough Lodge  ................................(208) 259-3326
Terrace Lakes Resort  ..........................(208) 462-3250
Terry Peterson - Real Estate.................(208) 608-4329
Trinity Home Care & Resource.............(208) 938-1760
Twisted Turkey......................................(208) 392-9757
Frank Walker - Law Firm.......................(208) 462-6388

CLASSIFIEDSCLASSIFIEDS

Schools  Announce

County website www.boisecoun-
ty.us, or call (208)793-2380. To 
apply, submit a filled-out Boise 
County employment application 
to mnewman@co.boise.id.us or 
mail to Boise County Road & 
Bridge Department, 39 Brown-
lee Road, Horseshoe Bend, ID 
83629. Pre-employment drug test-
ing is required. Boise County is an 
Equal Opportunity Employer and 
gives Veteran’s preference in its 
hiring practices.

Boise County Road & Bridge 
Department has an opening for 
a full time Equipment Opera-
tors in the Garden Valley area. 
Benefits include health insurance, 
paid vacation, paid sick time, paid 
holidays and PERSI retirement. 
Application and Job Description 
can be printed from the Boise 
County website www.boisecoun-
ty.us, or call (208)793-2380. To 
apply, submit a filled-out Boise 
County employment application 
to mnewman@co.boise.id.us or 
mail to Boise County Road & 
Bridge Department, 39 Brownlee 
Road, Horseshoe Bend, ID 83629. 
Pre-employment drug testing 
is required. Boise County is an 
Equal Opportunity Employer and 
gives Veteran’s preference in its 
hiring practices.

Trudys Kitchen is now hir-
ing Servers, Line Cooks, Prep 
Cooks and Dishwashers.

Multiple Positions Available 
at Garden Valley School - Guid-
ance Counselor, Long Term 
Classroom Substitutes, Substi-
tute for Teachers - immediately, 
K-8 Classroom Teacher, Part 
Time Kitchen Assistant (9am-
2pm), Custodian/Maintenance 
- Full-time, and Paraprofession-
als in Garden Valley. Send appli-
cation and supporting documents 
to scorn@gvsd.net or Garden Val-
ley School Administration Office, 
1053 Banks Lowman Rd., Garden 
Valley Idaho.

Classified Application: https://
www.gvsd.net/page/employment

Basin School District is look-
ing for substitute teachers.  Ap-
plications are available at the high 
school office.  Applicants must 
have a high school diploma and, 
if hired, pass a background check.   
Please call the Basin district office 
at 208-392-4183 extension 1274 if 
you need any additional informa-
tion.  Address for application pick 
up is 100 Centerville Rd, Idaho 
City ID., 83631

Basin School District #72 in 
Idaho City is accepting applica-
tions for a full time bus driver.  
Must have a Class B CDL. Salary 
is dependent on experience. Full 
benefits are included. 

District #72 is an equal oppor-
tunity employer. Applications 
are available at Idaho City High 
School office. Ask for a classified 
employment application. Salary 
starts at $14.00 an hour and up de-
pending on experience. Questions 
call Russ Taylor at 208-284-7966.

COMMUNITY
SERVICES:  
Garden Valley Food Bank/

Pantry: Distribution will be the 1st 
& 3rd Thursday of every month at 
the Sr Center from 8:30-11:30 am 
AND 2nd & 4th Friday of every 
month at Calvary Chapel 3:30-5 
pm.  Food drop off box is located 
in the GV Market. Contact Toni at 
208-315-5418 for more info.

Alcoholics Anonymous - Meet 
at the Crouch Community Church 
on Mondays & Thursdays at 
5:30pm.

Alcoholics Anonymous - Meet 
in Idaho City at 7pm on Fridays at 
the Library, 123 Montgomery St.

Crouch: Al-Anon support 
group for friends and family of al-
coholics meets weekly at Crouch 
Community Church on Tuesdays 
at 6:00 p.m. in the library.

Horseshoe Bend Pantry is 
open on the 2nd & 4th Friday of 
the month, located at the WICAP 
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Garden Valley Junior Varsity Volleyball

Boise County Road and Bridge De-
partment is currently understaffed 
and looking to fill four positions. Due 
to understaffing, expect delays in 
road service.  Garden Valley area cur-
rently has one part-time employee.  If 
you, or if anyone you 
know is looking for 
work, please visit the 
Boise County website 
and go to the employ-
ment tab. 

High School JV volleyball team won the first two sets to beat the 
Council Lumberjacks JV team  on Tuesday night, September 20th.

On Tuesday night, the GVHS Varsity Wolverines, despite digging deep, were not able to outplay the 
Council Lumberjacks and lost in three sets.			           Photos by Linda Ruppel, DDS


